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Hazel: the diary of a new supervisor 
 
1  
 
Dear John, 
 
Thank you very much for such an engaging and very insightful session recently. I 
definitely enjoyed it more than I thought I would and gained a lot from personal 
reflections that were stimulated by the narratives. 
 
The narrative at the end made me pause to reflect on my own position - I started this 
new position only recently and was immediately asked to supervise a couple of PhD 
students who are also work colleagues with whom I work with in a small team. Whilst I 
felt quite excited about supervising PhD students, I was very wary of the 'dual role' 
predicament I was being asked to engage in. However, I was new and was thrown 
these part-time PhD students very quickly and I didn't think I could say ‘no’. 
 
After having some time over the summer to think about this situation, I felt suddenly 
anxious about the multiple possibilities for a very messy relationship/situation to 
emerge. The students are very strong characters, which is great, but I wouldn't want to 
fall out with them. They are both very professional and I respect both of them as 
colleagues. I worry that because I look quite young that it will cause a problem if I have 
to tell them their work isn't good enough. I think this concern came about after one of 
them asked me what my age was - I'm not sure they'd do the same if I looked over 40 
or if I was male. 
 
So, after some thought, I constructed an email to my head of department expressing 
my concerns, my worries and the heavy responsibility I felt I was being given at such 
an early stage in my new role. We planned a meeting with the head and my line 
manager (with whom I am co-supervising one of these students).  
 
We discussed my concerns and my line manager mentioned that she had concerns 
because she is their line manager as well.  So this could potentially cause some 
additional problems. I said it felt a bit incestuous (if that was the right word!) and so 
some solutions were sought (e.g. Trying to avoid phd supervision days on the same 
days as meetings with the team which we have found out is going to be difficult). 
 
. I requested an advisor outside the dept but we were given a professor from another 
department to help if needed. We met up with him and we laughed so much I nearly 
cried - it made me realise that perhaps I could enjoy this experience and to try and 
stop worrying about worst case scenarios. Whilst it's important to prepare for the 
worst, I must remember to hope for the best and enjoy it when it's going well. 
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I have met with my first phd supervisee with the co-supervisor - an academic in 
another department (she's lovely - same methodological/philosophical page) and a 
3rd supervisor – a senior lecturer at another institution. (Not sure about him yet).  
 
I do find the 3rd supervisor situation slightly odd, partly because he comes to some of 
our department meetings as well. He has already mentioned potential external 
examiners (they sound like his mates) and the candidate has got six years part time 
studying to complete yet. I just hope there's not too many people/layers involved now 
because I worry the student might get pulled in too many different directions with 3 
supervisors!  
 
One of my supervisees described her PhD as a 'military operation' and she's entered 
into this by giving us the agenda, setting supervisory dates and letting us know our 
roles. She seems to have taken control of this. She responds well to my written 
feedback so far. 
 
I'm quite pleased that the phd students didn't not start exactly at the same time as I 
don't want either of them to be directly competing with each other. Also, I'm just 
thinking... because both are in the same team, I'm wary of giving one more attention 
than the other... I feel that I'm going to have to work quite hard to balance equal 
time/attention/guidance. 
 
I do feel listened to and supported by the department so far... but I'm not sure quite 
what I sort of support we should get. The training, the mentor and hope I do have the 
time to do a good job. The supervisees both are independent, motivated, professional, 
organised and mature women with very interesting ideas, and they're pleased they've 
found someone who is suitable to supervise them with similar interests so fingers 
crossed there are only a few bumps in the road before completing. 
 
That was far more than I was going to write (now I know why your narratives were so 
long!), but it's reminded me that perhaps a supervisory diary might be a good idea. I 
really hope I can balance the roles and my workload. 
 
Thanks again for a very engaging workshop.  
 
Best wishes, 
Hazel  
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Dear Hazel, 
 
Thanks for your comments on yesterday. I’m glad you found the workshop helpful. We 
were lucky that I had chosen that particular supervisor story to discuss.  
  
On your general situation: I do admire how seriously you are taking this responsibility. I 
think you have played it very well so far. But just one or two comments from outside: 
  

1. You are one of a team of supervisors. So involve all the team in all 
communications, meetings etc. as far as possible. It wasn’t clear to me what the 
role is of the third supervisor? 

2. I suggest all three of you agree with the candidate on procedures. It’s good that 
the first candidate is organised. So perhaps you all relate to that. Think how 
agendas for meetings are drawn up, Expect the candidate to send you all her 
‘minutes’ etc. Then, possibly end with ‘let’s return to this in x months’ time’. And 
'we can keep the contributions and membership of your supervisory panel 
under review'. 

3. Remember to act only as advisor, along with other supervisors. Remind the 
candidate from time to time that you have no part in the examination. So phrase 
all comments and feedback as ‘in my view…’ etc. 

4. Encourage the candidate to explore all ways of getting peer review from as wide 
a variety of groups as possible. This underlines that you are not the audience. 
Share with her my PowerPoint slide on ‘how to ensure you pass’? 

5. Point out that your relationship will develop over the six years. South African 
saying: ‘You give your kids roots and wings’? 

  
If you are willing I would very much appreciate it if you kept me posted - possibly 
every three months? and I could even post it as a live diary??  
  
Keep in touch. 
  
Best wishes 
 
John 
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Dear John, 
  
Thanks for getting back to me and for your very helpful advice. That South African 
saying is interesting… we tend to forget about roots – I’ve always been told to ‘spread 
my wings’ like Jonathan Livingstone Seagull but not worked on growing roots 
although I have learnt to do that myself thankfully! 
  
It’s not clear to me what the role of the 3rd supervisor is for me either… I’ll speak about 
this, but it’s good to be part of a team. 
  
I tend to take a stance on developing a student’s independence so I will ensure to 
remind them that I am just an advisor – and it’s helpful to say ‘in my view…’ That’s a 
really useful suggestion and has helped me to understand why my supervisor never 
came to my conferences or my talks. I guessed she was only being encouraging, but 
now it makes sense. I will use that questioning technique as well – it’s good to have 
the reminder, as it’s easy to fall into the trap of giving all the answers (wanting to help, 
but it doesn’t help in the long term). 
  
Anyway, I’m happy to contribute to a diary and appreciate the reflection this will offer 
me. 
  
Best wishes, 
  
Hazel 
 
 
4  
 
December 2015 
 
Dear John 
 
To bring you up to date with regards to PhD supervision supervisions have not started 
yet with the second supervisee. With the other one, we have had a couple of 
supervisions and she’s progressing well.  
 
One supervision fell on a strike day, which was slightly awkward, as she didn’t want to 
strike. In the end, I came in as there seems to be a slight ignorance in our department 
about UCU issues and I didn’t want to be the ‘black sheep’! Actually, in the supervisory 
meeting she said she might join and we were both very encouraging. Anyway, we’re 
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waiting to hear about the decision on her ethics approval, but going through the 
process gave me the opportunity to say, ‘in my opinion…’ and for it to be a piece of 
writing for an external audience - the reviewers (not me or her other supervisors) 
which shifts that responsibility. 
  
I think the third supervisor will act more as a mentor to this student – we have to have 
a third as none of us have had a completion and this was a way round it. I think it will 
work this way on both supervisory teams. We’ll have to see. They’re both external so 
this makes it more difficult to be involved anyway so I think in the long term, they will 
be a useful sounding board from a distance. 
  
The process of submitting her ethics went quite well and she values my detailed 
feedback. She is a very confident character and as a working colleague I’ve noticed 
that she does more talking than listening (and doesn’t always ‘listen actively’ as she 
likes to come across as very competent). I worry about her not listening to feedback, 
but she responds well to written feedback.  
 
There’s a saying, ‘we have two ears and one mouth for a reason’, but then we have 
two eyes too so I will rely on this written feedback more seeing as this seems to be 
how she responds better. I do tend to find that, generally, the majority of people don’t 
listen carefully or sincerely anyway – especially in academia where there are 
competing egos and most people want to talk about themselves (which obviously can 
be great for research purposes!) 
  
On another note, I have a feeling that the department might be putting this first 
supervisee forward to be head of the qualification (like a programme leader).  This 
would mean another dynamic, as I think she would then be my line manager. (I could 
be wrong and I would prefer it to be wrong as this would further complicate our 
relationship.) 
  
We had a departmental meeting yesterday and I get the impression that my 
supervisees also think it slightly embarrassing to speak openly about their progress. 
One even said ‘Well it’s difficult because she’s sat right there!’  So then, everyone looks 
at me and I have to look like it doesn’t matter.  
 
I find this quite a problem, as I don’t like that much attention in that way. It just feels so 
incestuous and I do feel like I’m going to have to work hard to negotiate all the various 
roles. 
 
Best wishes 
Hazel 
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5 
March 2016 
 
Dear John, 
  
I’ve got lots to add regarding supervision. I’ve been allocated another PhD student 
(who is not a colleague) so now I have three internal PhD students (two of whom are 
colleagues) and one external (four in total in the space of my first year supervising). I’m 
finding the feedback on drafts very time consuming and it’s amazing how quickly 
meetings come round. It feels like I’m always having meetings and perhaps I didn’t 
realize the amount of workload involved-phewy! 
  
I’ve taken on board your advice when providing feedback to some of my PhD 
students… saying things like ‘In my opinion…’ and have tried to provide students with a 
platform where their work is presented to other audiences (not just me). I managed to 
find the opportunity to remind one supervisee/colleague that it’s not me who gives 
them their PhD, it’s their external.  
 
I am wondering about one PhD student/colleague who seems to try to impress me 
quite a lot; she still hasn’t had any supervisions yet despite registering as a candidate.  I 
think she might need slightly more secure roots.  Perhaps always passing off my 
responsibility to the external might not always be helpful…  I remembered that she has 
already attempted to complete one PhD previously and she might be feeling insecure 
and need more reassurances. So I might try and balance that a bit more at this early 
stage in the supervision but again, it’s tricky because this she likes to present herself at 
work as very competent. 
  
Both student/colleagues have presented at conferences which seemed to have been 
valuable experiences for them. One seems highly motivated and comes to tutorials 
with an agenda. Despite being PT she acts like a FT student and is extremely 
organized. I’m very impressed with the progress she’s made although I get the 
impression that in the future, if we disagree on anything she might be quite difficult 
and try to point a finger at me. 
  
The additional PhD student I have been allocated has already failed his Viva, and has to 
resubmit in six months... So I’ve joined the supervisory team because I have a good 
understanding of his approach, which is what the external examiners criticized.  I have 
just discovered that the examiner who failed him was my own PhD supervisor - it all 
just becomes more and more incestuous! *sigh 
  
I’ve had lots of thoughts about this particular responsibility; I am worried that he might 
resubmit and the external fail him again. This makes me apprehensive, given that it will 
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be my first experience of preparing a student for their Viva. The current supervisory 
team includes someone I respect but who I have heard can be quite difficult. My 
impression is that the team did not have the time to provide him with sufficient 
supervision. But, fortunately, now I am on the team they have become more involved.  
 
I’ve not had a completion and am new to supervision… so it’s tricky navigating it all!  I 
am just trying to do what’s best for this student. He seems lovely, but busy, and I don’t 
think is as committed to the PhD as he could be.  There is a hell of a lot of work to do 
before resubmitting and I am trying to keep his motivation up.  It must be tough to 
have to untangle what has been done and rewrite a lot of it. It feels stressful and 
intense, but am just trying to remain on task. 
 
With regards to the role of third supervisor: sometimes they provide feedback on 
chapters/ethics and sometimes they don’t. I thought we would all three share 
feedback but my PhD student/colleague seems to want additional input from me even 
if the others have given feedback.  I don’t think she realizes just how much work this is. 
 
On another note, my additional mentor stepped down from his role as his workload 
was too great. I only had one meeting with him right at the beginning. They are 
looking to allocate someone else and they suggested someone who I wouldn’t want 
to be mentored by.  I’m not sure what’s going on. 
 
Sometimes I wonder if the PhD student/colleagues and other colleagues think I’m not 
pulling my weight on the team at work. My line manager had said I could be given less 
teaching. Again, I just keep trying to stay on task and not worry about things. 
  
 
 
6 
The following February, 2017 
 
Hello John, 
  
Well, I guess nearly 12 months have passed since my last diary, and quite a bit has 
happened since I sent my last report.  
 
One of my PhD students who had to resubmit finally submitted his draft last year and 
that was quite a relief. I guess what I am learning is that academia is a very small world 
and the external examiner was my old PhD supervisor which made my first PhD 
student Viva/completion even more nerve wracking!  
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But the Viva took place and it was much better than I’d expected; he was given 
substantial revisions but he still passed. Given what happened last time (he went off 
the radar a bit and didn’t finish his corrections) I have been setting small stepping 
stones for him to get to and to get this finished once and for all. He has said how 
grateful he is to me and keeps thanking me… and I guess I feel a bit uncomfortable and 
just say, I’m doing my job. But really, I am quite chuffed and it does feel rewarding. We 
are so close to the finish line now so that feels really satisfying. 
 
That’s the update on one PhD student who has been on such a long slog. 
There’s more success as well… another PhD student at another university has 
completed her conversion. This went really well, but I wasn’t worried because she is an 
excellent student. Again, I did feel really chuffed so it’s been working well so far over 
the last few months.  
 
I have realised that I am a big worrier and worry about a lot of things that could go 
wrong… and whether this is a good approach or not, at least I anticipate problems 
arising even if they don’t happen (although, perhaps I should have more faith in myself 
now). I guess my fear is not being able to help anyone or falling out with people… and I 
have really learned recently that even when these things happen it’s not the end of the 
world and can be salvaged and patched up.  
 
I do feel I am learning so much and growing as a supervisor now… I feel more 
confident at work as well although I am still a bit apprehensive about the other two 
PhD students as they are co-workers too and there is always a risk of tensioned 
relationships at work.  
 
I feel I am building a good relationship with one of these PhD students - the very self-
motivated one who refers to the PhD as a ‘military operation’ and I can see this going 
well.  
 
But I am a bit nervous of the other PhD student – I view her as a bit of a high-risk 
student because she has dropped out of a PhD previously. This is something I am 
aware of and try to give her deadlines for things but she is much less driven, prone to 
excuses, misses supervision and doesn’t seem as excited about her research.  
 
Also, the other PhD supervisor is our line manager and I get the impression that they 
talk a lot without me so I do feel a bit excluded. I’m aware that I feel a bit excluded 
from the team at work anyway though – I’m not sure whether this is me or whether I 
am excluded because I am supervisor, chair of the research group etc. I feel that this 
‘at risk’ PhD student has only decided to do a PhD student because of the other PhD 
student (colleague) who is ambitious and I don’t think this is a very valuable or intrinsic 
motivation.  
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I hope this shifts soon but I have my doubts - which could mean things get difficult… I 
am just probing gently anyway and I guess there is no rush if she is working part-time 
here. 
 
The third supervisor on both teams seems to have gone a bit quieter, which to be 
honest is a bit of a relief. Both are older white men and given the culture of science, 
can be domineering and entitled, which does make me roll my eyes a bit (a lot!). 
 
Outside the PhD supervision, just generally, I have decided to take more of a break 
from work colleagues during lunchtimes. I find it a bit hard work at lunch – people 
tend to talk about themselves a lot and I find that being ignored is slightly demoralising 
and my energy gets sucked as opposed to restored. Instead, I bring my dog in and 
walk her during lunch – fresh air, good company and a walk. All part of my ‘slow 
movement’ revolution! 
  
All good wishes, 
 
Hazel 
 
 
7 
September 2017 
 
Well, we last spoke a few months ago and I’m thinking back to what has happened. 
Two of my PhD students have passed their conversions and I’ve been put on another 
PhD team to help out with a PhD supervisor going off sick. I was told by the main 
supervisor that my input would not be needed and that I was literally just a fill in for 
paperwork’s sake. He seemed a bit controlling and put me in my place even though I 
was quite excited to be involved. Ah well, if that’s what he wants then I won’t do 
anything. They also said that I would probably be taken off once the other supervisor 
returns so I guess I do feel a bit used – more joys of the culture of academia which 
have started to grate at me. 
 
I guess you have caught me during a time when I am really losing the motivation for 
everything that is academia. If you want me to be honest, then I am wondering what 
the point of all this is. I feel undervalued, underpaid and overworked in general. I go 
above and beyond all my colleagues at work; I have PhD students, I publish like a 
machine, I volunteer for things, I have innovative ideas, I go to conferences… and I am 
the lowest paid member of staff on my team. I am told that the PhD supervision isn’t 
counted for promotion because this is for professorship. I guess I feel despondent and 
demotivated – I get pissed off with people thinking that I am happy to do this because 
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I enjoy it – I do (or did) enjoy it but I also think I should be rewarded for what I do. 
Nobody can have a carrot dangled in front of them for years without a reward. I am 
working 3 extra part time jobs on top of the full-time job which I am going above and 
beyond for because I see what others are doing in the department. Every week we 
have to record our whereabouts and what our new projects are etc. and I see that I am 
always doing stuff and nobody else is. 
 
I am asking myself, am I enjoying this? Of course, I want a promotion, but will I feel 
any different if I get it? Then I will be dangled another carrot… which just brings me 
back to the meaningless ladder of success. 
 
I’ve been thinking a lot about what I do and what any of it is worth. I’ve been thinking 
of taking a sabbatical. Then I worried that my PhD students might need me… I don’t 
think they do or will. I think it would be easy to replace me and I don’t think they are 
that bothered about me and that’s OK. It means I don’t have to worry about going on 
to do something else… outside academia. 
 
I think I am missing some sense of value and meaning. I don’t know what’s happened 
to me but I am experiencing some sort of experiential crisis. I feel like I have come to 
the end of this journey. I am looking to open a new chapter – I look around at other 
academics and there is quite a lot of melancholy and people are not enjoying the 
change going on here. It’s being filled with ‘management’ that just strips the joy from 
our academic experiences. 
 
During my PhD I thought all I could do was to go into academia. Now, I look at articles 
where someone has left academia because of the toxicity and they have gone on to 
do something fun and exciting and they are happy! The toxicity isn’t that bad where I 
am compared to other institutions, and I know that I am at the best place for me. I can 
work flexibly and don’t have to travel much and that suited me because I was a single 
mum. I still am a single mum but my child is getting older and I am just wondering 
whether I want to sign myself up for this for life. I am facing a turning point which has 
hit me… but it has been something I have felt restless for years about. 
 
I am wondering whether I am just missing some sort of challenge because I don’t feel 
academia is very challenging – it is challenging in ways that are not enjoyable, like 
keeping up with the constant stream of emails that never ever stop coming in even 
when you have some time off, the paperwork that builds up and up, the deadlines that 
force you to work late… this isn’t the challenge I want in life because I can do that 
easy! 
 
I want a challenge which is going to give me a buzz, a real buzz about being alive in 
the world. So, I’ve decided I’m going to have a horse riding lesson next week and see 
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how that feels. Maybe, it’s also a way of feeling connected to my Dad who also rode… 
I’m just going to try something different and see where it leads me. It might help ease 
my unsettlement and carry on with my job knowing I have some sense of adventure 
outside or it might help me to reflect on where I want to go instead. I don’t know, but I 
can’t just sit here feeling like this. 
 
I don’t feel that anything I do has been wasted, I have achieved a lot in a short space of 
time, but maybe this has been leading me to somewhere else, now I have the freedom 
to explore other options because my child is older. And maybe this is the opening of a 
new chapter. 
 
 
8 
February 2018 
 
On reflection, I think that the intensity of working closely in a team whilst supervising 
them has taken its toll on me. I've struggled with the demands involved in the small 
team dynamics which is probably why I have found it has dampened my working 
environment. The small minded negative politics in the group has meant that I have 
felt pushed out of the team - I feel I have sacrificed my position in the team so that the 
team doesn't have a negative impact on my wellbeing and to the experiences of their 
PhD supervision. The amount of negative toxic competition has taken its toll and I'm 
not sure this has been addressed at all. I think because it is quite nuanced it's difficult 
for my line manager to notice - plus my line manager is not an experienced PhD 
supervisor either - or an experienced or trained line manager. 
 
Basically, work has become more bearable because I have applied for two roles and 
been awarded them. One is as a PhD Mentor which involves working closely with a 
group of PhD students and their supervisors to ensure any issues that arise get 
addressed. I report to someone above me who sorts out any problems. The person I 
report to actually said to me that I was a “miracle worker” with one of the PhD 
students who finished last year, which I felt really chuffed about. I felt pleased that 
someone had noticed how hard I’d worked with that student. Anyway, I’m meeting 
them all this month so I’m really looking forward to working in this role as PhD 
supervision is one of the more rewarding jobs. It means that I can spend more time 
away from the intensity of the team which feels like a massive relief given my dual role 
as supervisor and colleague in such a small and competitive team. 
 
The environment at work is, however, so depressing - which is why it feels even more 
important to go and do something outside work which is so fulfilling. There’s talk of 
cutting modules, programs and making ALs redundant – no wonder it’s become so 
depressing! There's the current strike as well. Although this university is included, of 
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course nobody in my team are taking part, which whilst predictable, is demoralising 
because they all have partners to support them. Why is it always the ones who are 
well-off who are selfish? I've taken part this time but I definitely feel like the 'black 
sheep', and I do feel slightly resentful that others who can afford to strike, because 
they all have second incomes from their partners, don't. 
 
The other job is Co-Chair of the research group which is also more in line with what I 
enjoy about my job. These moves have helped but there’s a vibe that unless you are 
struggling and suffering like everyone else, you aren’t working hard enough. Well, I 
want to enjoy my life – martyrdom is overrated. 
 
In relation to PhD supervision, I’m just back to doing my job I guess. I’ve also been 
asked to examine a PhD externally which I’m looking forward to. It's hard to regain 
motivation after having such a dip at work and after realising that there is such a 
delayed sense of gratification that we are expected to accept. I'm finding it destroys a 
sense of meaning. There's a huge amount involved when supervising PhD students - 
the extent of reviewing is hugely draining and there's no time out of teaching to help 
re-energise us after such extensive and deep work. 
 
Yes, unfortunately I am still in academia, because I'm not in a position to just leave my 
job as I have so many financial obligations. However, I have started a new chapter 
outside academia… I really am learning to horse ride! It’s incredible and it’s helping me 
cope with the day job because I feel so much happier doing something that I love.  I 
get a real buzz from it and it is definitely challenging. Also, I think about my Dad a lot 
which is nice. Riding is a real joy and is enriching my life which is just what I needed! I 
hope that one day, I'll be in a position to leave academia (perhaps only work PT) and 
do something I love instead. If I do, then I will let you know! 
 
I'd highly recommend others to 'get out more', not to overinvest in work, treat it like a 
9-5pm job as much as possible and find something rewarding outside academia to 
give you something to work for. Since 2015 I have published over 100 articles in 
academic journals, chapters and online opinion pieces. I do enjoy research but again, 
this eventually becomes something you do for promotion, and I feel it's losing its 
meaning particularly when nobody recognises you for it. Also, where has my long list 
of publications got me? I have no idea who reads them and no idea if it's making a 
difference.  
 
Academia seems to be a culture whereby it's acceptable to work 24/7. Remember, it's 
a day job and there's only so much we can do. Why work if all you do is work? We 
work to live not live to work - cliché I know but when I thought about where I'll be in 5 
years with the direction HE is going in… I thought, well it's not here I'm afraid, so I'm 
not going to sit here and get more depressed. If I enjoy research and writing then I can 
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do that in any job actually - so maybe I will. In 5years time, I aim not to be in academia 
full time. 
 
Best wishes 
 
Hazel 
 
 
 
9 
February 2019 
One year later 
 
Since my last update a year ago, I think things deteriorated for me quite a bit and I was 
struggling to keep going at work. 6 months ago, I went off sick as the pressures and 
politics just became too much and I experienced burnout. After my last update, I was 
pushing myself to the limits, but I felt on a very low tolerance level and was worried I'd 
eventually crack and tell someone to just fuck off or worst still, hit someone. I 
accessed counselling through the employer's programme, but it wasn't long enough 
and it didn’t fix anything. It was my third year of taking on additional work in the hope 
of making a progression in my job so I was juggling a lot of balls and probably chasing 
a lot of meaningless carrots which were being dangled in front of me in return for 
doing lots of tasks above my current role. I think the additional political landscape 
surrounding academia and the country also added weight to my shoulders. There is a 
lot of insecurity and uncertainty for the future which heightens the anxiety of the daily 
pressures. 
 
Taking on the extra 2 departmental roles on top of other roles which were not 
'officially' recognised in my workload, running a conference, submitting funding 
applications, 5 x PhD student supervisions, taking on extra external examining 
responsibilities, and trying to be 'visible' online with social media tools and blogs etc 
really dragged me down. This was on top of two other part time jobs to help financially 
whilst balancing all of this and raising a daughter on my own. On top of this, I was 
experiencing quite a bit of unwarranted criticism from my line manager. The last straw 
for me was when they rejected my progression case and promoted my PhD student 
instead of me. They also promoted another man in my team to Professor who has no 
PhD, no research background and only 1 PhD supervision success because I did all his 
'dirty' work. I felt completely destroyed by the whole process and the institution 
seemed to take pleasure in rubbing salt in my wounds. I couldn't believe how cold 
they were and how they expected me to continue supervision by swallowing any 
resentment - a situation they had created and which they were responsible for. I am 
sad to say that I crumbled under the bitterness, resentment and pressures and whilst 
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there was a risk of having 'sour grapes' I just had to get out. Whilst everyone I spoke to 
about my progression case was completely shocked and even more so when I told 
them about my PhD student, it wasn't enough to get over the injustice of it all. 
 
There was one day, when I was in the office staring at my screen and pretending to be 
busy at my desk when one of the research leaders of the department walked past me 
and obviously noticed something was up with me. He said, "Hazel, let's go and have a 
chat about the research group". I followed him to his office, we sat down and chatted 
about the research group. I was extremely quiet because I feared that if I spoke I 
would just burst out crying. "Are you okay?" he asked, "Because you don't seem 
yourself" and I just started sobbing whilst struggling to hold back the tears. "Don't 
worry," he said, "I know what's happened and it's completely unfair. It happened to me. 
I've been trying to get promoted to professor and have had it blocked every time. I 
think it must be jealousy because we are creative. One day, I walked into this office 
and you see that chair? I kicked it so hard I lost my toenail and it took 2 years to grow 
back." We laughed sympathetically about it. "They put me on probation with weekly 
meetings after that and it was awful" he added, "But you have allies here." It felt very 
heart warming, but I couldn't push down the anger I felt and I realised then that I 
needed to go on leave because otherwise I would blow. I went off sick for 2 weeks 
and had not anticipated that it would accumulate to 6 months. 
 
Many things in my personal life seemed to happen after I went off sick. My dog died 
after a battle with cancer, I ended a controlling relationship and the worst bit was 
when I came home one evening to find that my daughter was self-harming. A 
traumatic night for both of us that I will never forget and I will never forget the deep 
raw red lines that I saw were cut into her wrist. It made me so angry to think that I'd 
put work before myself and before my personal life, perhaps before my daughter and 
that it had all accumulated to this. Everything else seemed to be crumbling around me 
but I was pleased that I was off work so I could dedicate time for my daughter. I felt 
even angrier towards work - fuck work! Also, I felt so guilty - had the stress I was 
experiencing trickled down so that she was experiencing it too? Had I missed the signs 
- teenagers are so tricky! I felt a mixture of guilt and anger but also of relief and 
fortune because at least I was able to be available now and give her the help she 
needed. It was definitely a very demanding time whilst I was off sick - I kept thinking 
about going back but when I went to the doctor's and told them what was going on I 
realised I wasn't ready to return. I had no time to really deal with my own anger but 
tried to access help as I knew I needed it. Unfortunately, the free access to help I 
received was from a young girl who's references were mainly to do with university 
because that's where she'd just come from. As a psychologist myself, I either needed 
someone who was well qualified or had a wealth of life experience in order to respect 
the help I was being offered and she offered neither. It was like talking to my daughter 
and I didn't think she'd be able to handle the shit I was dealing with about self-harm so 
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it wasn't that much help. I couldn't afford help for me because I was spending it on 
counselling for my daughter and when I called the employers programme again I had 
to wait a few more months before I could access counselling again because a year 
hadn't passed. It was tough and it was tough switching off from everything that had 
happened. Then, the more I was able to switch off the harder I found the possibility of 
ever going back to work. I realised just how much I was missing of happiness and life 
and it was definitely as a result of work - all the toxicity had made me so ill and 
unhappy. 
 
Six months passed and I called HR to check whether I was fully paid for 6 or 9 months 
because the sick policy said 6-9 months. They said it was 6 months but with the 
discretion of the head of department. Therefore, my sick leave pay was about to end 
but I hadn't received a letter. Unfortunately, they seemed to have no idea that my sick 
leave was about to end until I brought it to their attention when I called so I had to 
return to work as I couldn't afford not to receive full pay. I didn't feel ready but at least 
I was able to access support through work again. I am in the process of a phased 
return and I have accumulated quite a bit of leave so at least I will be able to use that. 
It's not easy and I had my first meeting with the team where I joined by Skype. My line 
manager welcomed me back and I said thanks. The room was completely silent which 
wasn't very reassuring so not much has changed. This is where not being a 'yes 
person' gets you - challenge the system and you're vilified out of Plato's cave which I 
find ironic in an academic institution where people are supposed to be 'Doctors of 
Philosophy'. I'm still as hated as ever and feel even more vilified so I'm literally hanging 
on by my teeth. However, if I've learned anything, I'm not going to let work ruin my 
health or my daughter's life. Now, I feel like I've gone passed the point of no return and 
I've got no motivation at all to write anything academic - I've gone from extremely 
productive to zero productivity academically. I write an anonymous blog about horse 
riding instead which gives me so much freedom - I can swear all I like and I don’t have 
to reference old white, balding, sexist men to 'convince' anyone that what I'm saying is 
valid. Until I can escape the realms of the hyper-managed institutional toxic breathless 
machine, I'm taking the advice from my sister who also works in academia. She says, 
'be like a rabbit' - come up every now and then, show your face but stay burrowed 
away and keep your head down.  
 
 
10 
October 2019 
 
Since my last diary entry, in February this year, I have spent the last 6-7 months settling 
back into work after returning from sick leave. It was tough to return to work and it did 
take a long time to work things through with various new challenges. Despite it being 
so tough, I do feel that I have grown and learned a lot in this time.  
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I have managed to work through a very difficult relationship with my line manager. I 
haven't got the outcome I wanted, but I do have an escape plan.  So I am working 
towards that with hope and optimism. 
 
In a way, I feel I have already left the job which may be why it's easier to cope with the 
disappointments. I have managed to sit down and recognise the positives of the job 
and am making the most of that. I am luckier than others who cannot work from 
home. I take advantage of the fact that I am very speedy at doing my job and do not 
take on additional stuff to fill the time.  I use the time to take care of my health instead 
(like walking, cycling, coffee with friends, pottering). 
 
In relation to PhD students, I have left the supervision teams of the ones in my team 
and have taken on a new one. Again, I feel I am working at the margins as my focus Is 
not on being an academic anymore. It is very difficult to invest any energy in academic 
work as my mind has already moved on to what my future will be outside academia. 
For this reason, it wouldn’t be fair to take on anymore PhD students, even though I do 
get asked quite a bit. I will do my job well for the one PhD student and maintain good 
relationships with the other supervisors. I do like the team and it is much more 
enjoyable than being involved in a team where the roles are blurred and there are 
conflicts of interest. I've realised how much I was taking on in the past and am pleased 
I have less of a sense of responsibility. 
 
In terms of research, I am still writing but not as much as I was. The writing is on a 
personal level for me. I managed to get something published in a professional 
magazine and got paid for my article - more than what I got paid writing a whole 
academic monograph. So it just goes to show how much academics are exploited 
really. I did send it in anonymously initially - though and I now wonder whether they 
thought I was male and thus offered to pay me more.  
 
The more I move towards progressing my future outside work, the more I can cope 
with the pressures.  They really do roll off like water off a duck's back. Perhaps, if I'd 
learned how to do that more before getting to this stage, then I might not have gotten 
to this point.  I think the academic system relies on and exploits certain characters 
who want to 'make a difference'. But I'm not sure how achievable this is. This type of 
character will always want to take on more than they should because of the hope of 
making a real difference in the world.  
 
If I want to make a difference in future then maybe I will volunteer for a charity, but if I 
am an employee then I should not be expected to do things that are voluntary whilst 
having the hope of a promotion dangling in front of me.  
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I know I'm not the only person who has experienced the lack of recognition for my 
merits. Another colleague has noted how they feel like a failed academic because they 
didn't make ‘professor’ despite all the publications and innovative work they've done 
for students.  
 
It seems that for success in academia you must be a type - not questioning the 
system. I'm always doing that.  I am not apologetic about it because I believe that is 
what makes a good academic. But I'm not going to stay in a career or a place that 
makes me unhappy.  
 
The whole culture has changed and the values and beliefs that once embodied 
academia have evolved into a structure that benefits the 'man as machine' and 
management type.  
 
I cannot conform to this for my health. I will not sacrifice my own values and morals to 
fit in to a bullying system that damages good people. Work is a huge part of our lives 
and I have given enough of myself.  I now want to do something that is going to make 
me happy.  
 
I am close to achieving my new goal and as soon as next year I may start making my 
move out of academia.  
 


